
SenesTech Announces Distribution Agreement with Agri-Turf Distributing,
LLC

FLAGSTAFF, Ariz., Aug. 16, 2018 — SenesTech, Inc. (NASDAQ: SNES), a developer of
proprietary technologies for managing animal pest populations through fertility control, today
announced a distribution agreement for ContraPest® with Agri-Turf Distributing, LLC (“Agri-
Turf”), a pest management distributor based in Santa Fe Springs, California.

“Agri-Turf’s management team has deep experience in the pest management industry,
particularly in the California market, and their team believes in delivering the most innovative
technology and products to their customers. They specialize in providing excellent service
and coverage in market niches that complement our current distribution coverage,” says Joe
Malinowski, V.P. of Sales for SenesTech. “Our partnership and shared commitment to provide
proven solutions for pest management professionals (PMPs), will be the cornerstone for
continued growth in California, one of the largest markets in the US pest control industry.”

In addition to distribution, SenesTech and Agri-Turf will partner on marketing initiatives and
product trainings to support continued awareness and growth within the California market.

“We are excited about the opportunity to carry this new rodent control product, and we look
forward to introducing ContraPest to PMPs as a new tool that has the ability to enhance their
rat management programs,” said Rich Records, President of Agri-Turf.

Agri-Turf will be a stocking distributor, and has placed their initial stocking order.

About ContraPest

ContraPest® is an innovative technology that targets the reproductive capabilities of Norway
and roof rats. As a highly palatable liquid, the formulation promotes sustained consumption,
helping to reduce fertility in both male and female rats, bringing populations down and
keeping them down. Our delivery system is designed to minimize handler exposure, and
ContraPest is dispensed inside tamper resistant bait stations, minimizing the risks to non-
target species.

As a versatile tool, ContraPest can be used within Integrated Pest Management (IPM)
programs to help reduce reproduction and magnify the success of IPM protocols or as a
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standalone, non-lethal solution for customers that are looking to reduce or eliminate the use
of lethal methodologies.

ContraPest is a Restricted Use Pesticide, due to applicator expertise. Please read and comply
with all label instructions. Target species: Norway and roof rats.

About SenesTech
SenesTech has developed and is in the process of commercializing a proprietary technology
for managing animal pest populations, primarily rat populations, through fertility control. For
more information visit the SenesTech website at www.senestech.com.

About Agri-Turf Distributing, LLC
Agri-Turf Distributing, LLC is a privately held, employee-owned company based in Santa Fe
Springs, California. Established in 2013, the company serves licensed applicators in the
professional pest management, fumigation, golf, turf and ornamental, vegetation
management, and vector control industries in California.

Safe Harbor Statement
This release contains “forward-looking statements” within the meaning of Section 27A of the
Securities Act of 1933, as amended, and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934,
as amended and such forward-looking statements are made pursuant to the safe harbor
provisions of the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. “Forward-looking
statements” describe future expectations, plans, results, or strategies and are generally
preceded by words such as “may,” “future,” “plan” or “planned,” “will” or “should,”
“expected,” “anticipates,” “draft,” “eventually” or “projected.” You are cautioned that such
statements are subject to a multitude of risks and uncertainties that could cause future
circumstances, events, or results to differ materially from those projected in the forward-
looking statements, including the risks that actual results may differ materially from those
projected in the forward-looking statements as a result of various factors and other risks
identified in our filings with the Securities and Exchange Commission. Forward-looking
statements include but are not limited to, our expectations regarding Agri-Turf’s sales,
marketing, training, promotions and projects relating to ContraPest. All forward-looking
statements contained in this press release speak only as of the date on which they were
made and are based on management’s assumptions and estimates as of such date. We do
not undertake any obligation to publicly update any forward-looking statements, whether as
a result of the receipt of new information, the occurrence of future events or otherwise.

CONTACT:
Investor: Robert Blum, Joe Dorame, Joe Diaz, Lytham Partners, LLC, 602-889-9700,
senestech@lythampartners.com

Company: Tom Chesterman, Chief Financial Officer, SenesTech, Inc., 928-779-4143
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Agri-Turf: Andrea Vogt, Marketing Manager, Agri-Turf Distributing, 562-370-0270

 View original content with
multimedia:http://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/senestech-announces-distribution-agr
eement-with-agri-turf-distributing-llc-300698379.html
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